Subject: Re: BID check signing

From: Jim Omahen

Date: 06/20/2016 10:39 AM

To: Laurie Goldman

CC: 'Lisa Schechter' <lisa@mediadistrict.org>

Thanks and terrific. Tomorrow would be better and we may have mail today with a few more bills. | will tell the front gate you will be here
1:30-2pm. Thanks again and stay cool!

Jim Omahen, Operations Manager
Hollywood Media District BID
1040 N. Las Palmas Ave.
Hollywood, CA 90038

Ph 323.860.0088

Fax 323.860.0089

MediaDistrict.org

From: Laurie Goldman <laurielgoldman@earthlink.net>
Date: Monday, June 20, 2016 at 10:28 AM
To: 'Jim Omahen' <jim@mediadistrict.org>

Cc: Lisa Schechter <lisa@mediadistrict.org>
Subject: RE: BID check signing

Hi love!

I can come by to sign checks tomorrow between 1:30-2:00. | have back to back meetings downtown from 9:15-12:30.
I am home all day today (my car is in the shop). Your more than welcome to drive over, but you don’t have to. | can come to
you tomorrow. Just get me parking J

X0,
Laurie

From: Jim Omahen [mailto:jim@mediadistrict.org]
Sent: Monday, June 20, 2016 10:24 AM

To: Laurie Goldman

Cc: Lisa Schechter

Subject: BID check signing

Laurie, | would like to get bills paid before | leave on vacation. Would you be available to sign checks either today or tomorrow? Also, | can
come to you if that would be easier for you. Please let me know and thanks.

Jim Omahen, Operations Manager
Hollywood Media District BID
1040 N. Las Palmas Ave.
Hollywood, CA 90038

Ph 323.860.0088

Fax 323.860.0089

MediaDistrict.org




